
 

 

INTERNAL QUALITY ASSURANCE CELL 

IQAC Minutes and the Action Taken Report 
 

(Academic Year-2021-22) 

 
Date: 19 June 2021  

IQAC Meeting -1 
The online meeting of the IQAC was arranged on 19th June 2021 to discuss the 

internal quality of the college and the Action Taken during the year is as follows: 

Minutes  Action Taken 

1. Review and confirmation 

of last meeting 

 

2. To Review Academic 

progress. 

• Academic progress is found satisfactory. 

• Video lectures are prepared by teachers and 
shared on WhatsApp group of students. 

3. To conduct an internal 

evaluation. 

• Online internal evaluation is conducted 

4. To discuss the role of 

Dattak Palak in 

University exam form 

submission 

• The Mentor contact with mentee and inform 
them to online submission of exam form  

5. To Scrutinise & confirm 

the CAS proposals of 

eligible teachers. 

 

• 5 Teacher successful promoted to next 
academic level through CAS camp 

6. Any other topic with prior 

permission. 

a.  Tree Plantation 

  

b. To conduct Online 

departmental 
activity. 

 
 

 

 

• Botanical Garden is strengthened with 
compound wall and verities of trees 

 

• Online Yoga session on International Yoga 
Day was Organised. 

 

• Organised online Sanskrit saptha and 
Hindi saptha. 
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INTERNAL QUALITY ASSURANCE CELL 

IQAC Minutes and the Action Taken Report 
 

(Academic Year-2021-22) 

 
Date: 1 September 2021

  
IQAC Meeting -2 

The meeting of the IQAC was arranged on 1st September 2021 to discuss the 

internal quality of the college and the Action Taken during the year is as follows: 

Minutes  Action Taken 

1.  To Read and 
confirmation of last 

meeting 

 

2.  Appoint/Welcome new 

members in IQAC. 

New members of IQAC appointed. 

Mr. Ramchandra Alure-Management 
representative. 
Mr. Shivshankar Andhalkar-Industry nominee 

Chairman and Managing Director, Agrimo Agro 
Idustries Pvt. Ltd. Chicholi MIDC, Solapur. 

 

3.  To discussion the 
Academic Calendar and 

prepare a departmental 
academic calendar. 

• All departments prepared their academic 
calendar. 

4.  To organize COVID 

Vaccination for students. 

• COVID 19 vaccination camp is organized on 
college. 

5.  To organize webinars, 

seminars, workshops, etc. 

 

• Webinars, seminars were organised. 

6.  Any other topic with prior 
permission. 
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INTERNAL QUALITY ASSURANCE CELL 

IQAC Minutes and the Action Taken Report 
 

(Academic Year-2021-22) 
 

Date: 22 November 2021
  

IQAC Meeting -3 
The meeting of the IQAC was arranged on 22nd November 2021 to discuss the 

internal quality of the college and the Action Taken during the year is as follows: 

 
 

Minutes  Action Taken 

1. To Review and confirm 

the proceeding of last 
meeting 

 

2. To prepare AQAR reports 
for 2020-21. 

• IQAC with help of 7 criteria prepared AQAR 
for 2020-21 

3. To Scrutinize & confirm 
the CAS proposals of 
eligible teachers. 

• One faculty promoted as Professor through 
CAS camp. 

4. Planning of webinar on 

Remote sensing 

 

• Webinar on Remote sensing in collaboration 

with international institute organized 
successfully. 

5. To organize employment 
base activity 

• Organised workshop on geranium lagwad 
and sugandhi tel nirmity 

6. Any other topic with prior 

permission. 
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INTERNAL QUALITY ASSURANCE CELL 

IQAC Minutes and the Action Taken Report 
 

(Academic Year-2021-22) 
 

Date: 13 January 2022  
IQAC Meeting -4 

The meeting of the IQAC was arranged on 13th January 2022 to discuss the 
internal quality of the college and the Action Taken during the year is as follows: 

 

 

Minutes  Action Taken 

To Review and confirm the 
proceeding of last meeting 

 

To strengthen the Earn and 

Learn scheme. 

Workshop on CFL bulb making is organized 
successfully. 

To organize seminars, webinars, 

and workshops for students and 

teachers 

Seminars, Workshop, webinars organized. 

To overlook the Progress of 

AQAR for the year 2020-21 

AQAR submitted on 18/08/2022 

To organize a workshop on 

NAAC Framework under FDP 

Workshop on NAAC related quality enhancement 

was organized on 28 January   

 Any other topic with prior 

permission. 
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INTERNAL QUALITY ASSURANCE CELL 

IQAC Minutes and the Action Taken Report 
 

(Academic Year-2021-22) 
 

Date: 4 February 2022  
IQAC Meeting -5 

The meeting of the IQAC with all departments was held from 04/02/2022 to 

09/02/2022 in a different time slot to discuss departmental plans and the Action 

Taken during the year is as follows: 

 

Minutes  Action Taken 

04/02/2022  

Departments takes initiative and 
organized 

1. Guest Lectures 
2. Certificate course 

3. MOU 
4. National/International 

Seminars/Workshops/Webinars. 

12.30 to 1.00 pm Department of 

Commerce 

1.30 to 2.00 pm Department of Sociology 

2.00 to 2.30 pm Department of Zoology 

2.30 to 3.00 Department of English 

05/02/2022 

12.00 to 12.30 pm Department of  

Sanskrit 

1.30 to 2.00 pm Department of Marathi 

2.00 to 2.30 pm Department of Political 
Science 

2.30 to 3.00 Department of Economic 

8/2/22  

12.30 to 1.00 pm Department of 
Mathematics 

2.00 to 2.30 pm Department of Geography 

2.30 to 3.00 Department of Chemistry 

9/2/22 

12.00 to 12.30 pm Department of Hindi 

12.30 to 1.00 pm Department of Physics 

2.00 to 2.30 pm Department of Botany 

2.30 to 3.00 Department of History 
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INTERNAL QUALITY ASSURANCE CELL 

IQAC Minutes and the Action Taken Report 
 

(Academic Year-2021-22) 
 

Date: 25 February 2022
  

IQAC Meeting -6 
The meeting of the IQAC was arranged on 25th February 2022 to discuss the 

internal quality of the college and the Action Taken during the year is as follows: 

 
 

Minutes  Action Taken 

To Review and confirm the 

proceeding of last meeting 

 

To submit departmental reports 

in the given format of all 

departments. 

Departmental reports are collected for AQAR 

submission and preparation for NAAC cycle 3 

Any other topic with prior 
permission. 
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INTERNAL QUALITY ASSURANCE CELL 

IQAC Minutes and the Action Taken Report 
 

(Academic Year-2021-22) 
 

Date: 12 March 2022  
IQAC Meeting -7 

The meeting of the IQAC was arranged on 12th March 2022 to discuss the 
internal quality of the college and the Action Taken during the year is as follows: 

 

 

Minutes  Action Taken 

To Review and confirm the 
proceeding of last meeting 

 

To start offline teaching 
effectively. 

Offline teaching started after 2nd lockdown from 
14 March 2023 according to government 

guidelines 

To prepare the academic 
calendar for the second term. 

Academic calendar for second term is prepared 

To strengthen the Dattak Palak 

(Mentor-Mentee) scheme. 

All Mentor contacted to mentee. 

To discuss the planning of 
Cultural Committee, NSS 
Committee, Competitive exam 

committee planning. 

Cultural, NSS and competitive exam committee 

prepared and workout their program.  

To apply for DBT star college 

scheme. 

Applied for star DBT scheme. 

Campus Interview arrangement. Campus interview of Dhoot transmission 
organized on 26th March 

To organize Convocation 

Programme. 

Convocation Programme organized on 22nd April. 

To organize regular NSS camp. NSS camp organized from 19 to 25 March 

 Any other topic with prior 

permission. 
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INTERNAL QUALITY ASSURANCE CELL 

IQAC Minutes and the Action Taken Report 
 

(Academic Year-2021-22) 
 

Date: 09 May 2022  
IQAC Meeting -8 

The meeting of the IQAC was arranged on 9th May 2022 to discuss the internal 
quality of the college and the Action Taken during the year is as follows: 

 

 

Minutes  Action Taken 

To Review and confirm the 
proceeding of last meeting 

 

To organize National seminar 

on national education policy 

2020 and syllabus framing 

according to CBSE pattern  

Successfully organized National seminar on 
‘National education policy 2020 and syllabus 

framing according to the CBCS pattern’  
The seminar was held on 21st May 2022. We are 

the first from affiliating University and second from 
Maharashtra who organized such activity on NEP 

2020 

 Any other topic with prior 
permission. 
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INTERNAL QUALITY ASSURANCE CELL 

IQAC Minutes and the Action Taken Report 
 

(Academic Year-2021-22) 
 

Date: 10 May 2022  
IQAC Meeting -9 

The meeting of the IQAC with criterion coordinators was arranged on 10th May 
2022 to discuss the internal quality of the college and the Action Taken during the 
year is as follows: 

 
 

Minutes  Action Taken 

To Review and confirm the 

proceeding of last meeting 

 

Criteria-wise discussion for 

quality enhancement 

Criteria wise preparation for cycle 3 is started. 

Any other topic with prior 

permission. 
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INTERNAL QUALITY ASSURANCE CELL 

IQAC Minutes and the Action Taken Report 
 

(Academic Year-2021-22) 
 

Date: 5 August 2022  
IQAC Meeting -10 

The meeting of the IQAC with all staff members was arranged on 5th August 2022 
to discuss the internal quality of the college and the Action Taken during the year is 
as follows: 

 
 

Minutes  Action Taken 

To Review and confirm the 

proceeding of last meeting 

 

To finalize and submit AQAR 

2020-21 

AQAR submitted on 18th August. 

To prepare an AQAR for 2021-

22 

AQAR is prepared and submitted  

Discussion to face NAAC for III 

cycle 

IIQA submitted on 28 March 2023 

 Any other topic with prior 
permission. 

• Organize FDP on the new 

NAAC framework for all 

staff members. 

• To Scrutinize & confirm 
the CAS proposals of 
eligible teachers 

 

  
 

 

• A lecture series under FDP of IQAC 
coordinators and Principals of 3 colleges 

who got A and A+ grade in NAAC is 
organized. 

• 7 eligible staff members got promotion 

under CAS 
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